
Year 2 Home Learning Tasks 

Autumn Term – 1st half 

Please complete the purple spelling activity and then at least 4 other activities by the end week beginning 13th October. 

We would also like you to complete the Maths and spelling sheets, which will be provided weekly. These will be given out 

each Friday. Spellings will be tested on Friday and Maths will need to be returned the following Wednesday each week. 

 

Write a book review for a favourite 
book. (Collect a template from the 
homework box if you need one.) 

Make a fact file about an amphibian of 
your choice. You could make a poster, 
top trumps style cards, a booklet or 
anything else you can think of. 

Create a piece of art based around sea 
creatures. You could paint, draw, 
collage etc. Try experimenting with 
patterns and colour mixing. 

Make a diary to show what you eat 
and how much physical activity you 
have completed in a week. 

Learn to read and spell these Year 2 
Common Exception words –  
 
Door, floor, poor, because, find, kind, 
mind, behind, child, children, wild, 
climb 

Write a short story about some sea 
creatures. You could write it on one 
page or make a booklet with pictures. 
Remember to use capital letters and 
full stops correctly. 

Find out a fact about each of the 
continents. You could write your facts 
on a blank world map. (Take a map 
from the homework box if you need 
one.) 

Make a map of a journey you do 
regularly e.g. your journey to school. 
What do you see? What do you go 
past? When do you turn? 


